
Bid Results
FD12-0549F

Class B Uniforms

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED QTY. UNIT UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1 Lion #2106-40

Male Navy Trouser

Sizes 28-52 600 EA 175.88$            105,528.00$         111.65$            66,990.00$            Bid Substitute 101.17$            60,702.00$            116.50$            69,900.00$            No Bid

2 Lion Uniform Shirt, 1457-10 

Uniform Short Sleeve

Sizes Small to 3XLarge

Nomex - Midnight Navy

Shoulder Epaulettes

Snap Front 300 EA 121.44$            36,432.00$            77.10$              23,130.00$            Bid Substitute 69.14$              20,742.00$            80.99$              24,297.00$            No Bid

3 Lion Uniform Shirt, 1457LS-10 

Uniform Long Sleeve

Sizes Small to 3XLarge

Nomex - Midnight Navy

Shoulder Epaulettes

Snap Front 300 EA 138.19$            41,457.00$            87.75$              26,325.00$            Bid Substitute 78.67$              23,601.00$            91.99$              27,597.00$            No Bid

4 Lion #7114-30

Female Navy Trouser

Sizes 28-52 120 EA 46.06$              5,527.20$              114.85$            13,782.00$            Bid Substitute 102.51$            12,301.20$            119.99$            14,398.80$            No Bid

5 Lion #2106BK-10 

Male Black Trouser

Sizes 28-52 120 EA 184.25$            22,110.00$            117.00$            14,040.00$            Bid Substitute 107.08$            12,849.60$            121.99$            14,638.80$            No Bid

6 Flying Cross 85R5400 

Men’s Short Sleeve Police Shirt, 

White 60 EA 30.38$              1,822.80$              24.30$              1,458.00$              Bid Substitute No Bid 40.00$              2,400.00$              No Bid

7 Flying Cross 35W5400 

Men’s Long Sleeve Police Shirt, 

White 36 EA 34.50$              1,242.00$              27.90$              1,004.40$              Bid Substitute No Bid 42.50$              1,530.00$              No Bid

730.70$            214,119.00$         560.55$            146,729.40$         -$                   -$                        458.57$            130,195.80$         613.96$            154,761.60$         -$                   -$                        -$                   -$                        
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Sustainability efforts 
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See Attached.

Prompt Payment Discount _____% _____ days net 30

Small Business Enterprise (SBE)?

Does your firm collect and remit sales tax to the state of 

Washington? 

Does your firm accept payment by Visa credit card?  

Does your firm accept payment by EFT/ACH

Delivery Time

Per Mfr

Warranty terms

Vendor GL. N. Curtis & Sons Gall's LLC Outdoor Outfits SeaWestern Kroesen's Uniform Co. NAFECO

Return/Exchange policy


